
Proceedings oe Common Council

SPECIAL SESSION—April 29, 1

The Common Council of the City of Indianapolis, met in the Council

Chamber, Monday evening, April 29th, A. D. 1889, at 7:30 o'clock, in

special session, pursuant to the following call

:

To the Members of the Common Council:

Gentlemen:—You are hereby requested to meet in special session this, the 29th
day of April, 1889, at the hour of 7:30 o'clock, for the purpose of approving the re-

appraisement of market stalls; also, the consideration of G. O. 59, 1888, and for no
other purpose. C. S. Denny, Mayor.

Present—Hon. Caleb S. Denny, Mayor, and ex officio President of the Common
Council, in the Chair, and 14 members, viz: Councilmen Burns, Cummings,
Davis, Dunn, Elliott, Gaul, Hicklin, Johnston, Markey, McClelland, Parkinson,
Pearson, Thalman, and Wilson.

Absent, 11—viz: Councilmen Coy, Darnell, Finch, Gasper, Kelley, Long, O'Con-
nor, Smith, Stuckmeyer, Swain, and Trusler.

MESSAGES AND PAPERS FROM THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN.

The following message was read, and the amendment concurrently

adopted

:

To the Mayor and Common Council

:

Gentlemen:—The Board of Aldermen in regular session held in the Aidermanic
Chamber Monday evening, April 22d, 1889, adopted the following amendments to

G. 0.59, 1888:

By striking out all of Section three, and re-numbering Section four as three, and
re-numbering Section five as four.

And then passed the ordinance as amended.
I submit the same for your consideration.

For the Board of Aldermen :

Michael W. Toomey, Clerk.

The following entitled ordinance, as thus amended, was then ordered
engrossed, and read the third time :

G. O. 59, 1888—An ordinance to amend Sections 9 and 10, of General Ordinance
No. 2, 1887, entitled "An ordinance supplemental to the ordinance of the City of

Indianapolis, on the subject of the general markets of said city; modifying and,

changing certain rules heretofore existing for the regulation and government of
said markets; repealing all conflicting provisions; putting the Market- Masters
on salaries, and requiring that all rents and fees of marketers shall be paid into

the treasury ;

" ordained and established March 21st, 1887, and to regulate the
time of holding markets.

sig. 24. [248]
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And it was passed by the following vote:

Ayes, 12—viz: Councilmen Burns, Dunn, Elliott, Gaul, Hicklin, Markey, Mc-
Clelland, Parkinson, Pearson, and Thalman.

Nays. 2— Councilmen Cummings, and Davis.

REPORTS, ETC., FROM STANDING COMMITTEES.

The Committee on Markets, through Councilman Wilson, submitted
the following report ; which was approved :

To the Mayor and Common Council:

Gentlemen:—The undersigned, Committees on Markets of the Common Council
and Board of Aldermen, report that on Friday. April 26, unanimously agreed upon
the following re appraisement of prices to be fixed on the Stalls, Stands and Spaces
to be sold at public auction on Monday, May 13th, at 9 o'clock, a. m :

Bids less than $15.00 will not be received for the following Stalls under Tomlin-
son Hall: Nos. 182, 133, 136, 137, 140 and 141.

Bids le?s than $20.00 will not be received for the following Stalls : Nos. 4, 5, 8, 9,

13, 16, 17, 20, 21, 24, 25, 28, 29, 32, 83, 36, 37, 40, 41, 44, 45, 48, 49, 52, 53, 56, 57, 60,

62, 64, 65, 68, 69, 72, 73, 76, 77, 80, 81, 84, 85. 88, 89, 92, 93, 96, 97, 100, 101, 104,

105, 108, 109, 112, 113, 116, 117, 120, 121, 124, 125, 128, 129, 134, 138 and 140.

Bids less than $25.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 1, 12, 14,

59, 61, 86, 107, 110, 119, 122, 131, 139 and 143.

. Bids less than $30.00 will not be received for the following Stalls : Nos. 11,18, 19,

23, 26, 35, 38, 47, 50, 71, 74, 83, 87, 95, 98, 115, 135 and 142.

Bids less than $35.00 will not be received for the following Stalls : Nos 15, 30, 31,

34, 39, 42, 43, 54, 55, 58, 67, 75, 78. 79, 82, 90, 91, 102, 103,^106, 111, 114, 118, 123,

126, 127 and 130.

Bids less than $40.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 6, 7, 10,

22, 46, 63, 66, 70, 94 and 99.

Bids less than $50.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 2, 3, 27
and 51.

Bids less than $80.00 will not be received for the following Spaces: B, C, D, E
and F.

Bids less than $360.00 will not be received for the room on the corner of Dela-

'

ware und Market streets; and not less than $800.00 for the room on the southeast

corner under Tomlinson Hall.

ESAT BUILDING— MEAT MARKET.

Bids less than $25 00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 11, 12,

13, 14, 15, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93 and 94.

Bids less than $35.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 16, 34,

43, 62, 65 and 68.

Bids less than $40.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 9, 10, 33,

35, 37, 40, 42, 44, 61, 63, 64, 66, 67, 69, 70, 71, 86, 95 and 96.

Bids less than $15.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 8, 72,

85 and 97.

Bids less than $50.00 will not be received for the following Stalls : Nos. 7, 19, 2()>

23, 38, 39, 82, 87, 88 and 98.

Bids less than $'60.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 2, 3, 4, :

17, 21, 22, 24, 26, 29, 30, 32, 45, 47, 48, 51, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 60, 73, 75, 76, 77, 78,

79, 81, 83, 84, 101, 102 and 103.

Bids less than $70.00 will not be receive! for the following Stalls: Nos. 1, 5, 6,

27, 28, 49, 50, 59, 74, 99, 100 and 104.
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Bids less than $75.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 36, 41,

53 and 80.

Bids less than $80.00 will not be received for the following Stalls: Nos. 18, 25,

31, 46 and 52.

No bid less than $25.00 will be received for the spaces on the north side of Mar-
ke street, between Delaware and Alabama streets.

Each of the spaces located on both sides of Alabama street, from Market to Wa-
ba-h street, are appraised at $15.00. N o bid less than this amount, shall be received.

he spaces east of the meat market, on the north side of the north sidewalk of Mar-
ket street, are appraised at $25.00. No bid less than this amount will be received.

The spaces located on the south side of Market street, between Delaware and
Al.ibarna streets, were appraised at $15.00. No bid less than this amount will be
received.

The spaces located on the east side of Delaware street, between Market and Court
streets, were appraised at $20.00. No bid less than this amount will.be received.

We ask that our report in this matter be approved.

We further recommend that the spaces be reduced to eight feet, instead af nine,

and that this space shall constitute a stand ; that the same be measured by the City
Civil Engineer along the curb siones on both sides of Market street, both sides of
the sidewalk of Alabama street; also the inside of the sidewalk east from the Meat
Market to Alabama street; also the east side of Delaware si reel, from Wabash
street to Court street. Respectfully submitted,

M. F. Connett, D. F. Swain,
H. W. Laut, W. H. Wilson,
M. M. Reynolds, M. J. Burns,
Aldermanic Committee. Council Committee.

On motion, the Common Council then adjourned, at 8:30 o'clock, p. m.

Attest

:

*..v...K *. vr ^.*r*>r...^rr:...^7. .... >
Mayor,

President of the flbmrr.nn Council.

, City Clerk.
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Proceedings of Board of Aldermen.

SPECIAL SESSION—April 29, 1889.

The Board of Aldermen of the City of Indianapolis, met in the Alder

manic Chamber, Monday evening, April 29th, A. D. 1889, at eight

o'clock, in special session, pursuant to the following call

:

Indianapolis, April 29, 1889.

To the President of the Board of Aldermen of the City of Indianapolis:

You are hereby requested to convene the Board of Aldermen of the City of In-
dianapolis in special session on Monday evening, April 29th, 1889, at the hour of
eight o'clock, to consider such matters as may come before said Board.

J. H. Taylor, H. B. Smith,
M. M. .Reynolds, John Kail,

M. F. Connett, H. H. Laut.

Indianapolis, April 29th, 1889.

To the Members of the Board of Aldermen of the City of Indianapolis

:

Gentlemen:—You are hereby requested to meet in special session of the Board of

Aldermen, in the Aldermanic Chamber, on Monday evening, April 29th, 1889, at

the hour of eight o'clock, for the purpose of considering; such matters as may come
before said Board. G. S. Wright, President

of the Board of Aldermen.

It appearing that all members had been duly notified of said meeting,
the following roll call was had :

Present—Hon. Granville S. Wright, President of the Board of Aldermen, in the
Chair, and Aldermen Connett, Laut, Rail, Reynolds, Smith, and Taylor— 7.

Absent, 3—viz: Aldermen Clark, Reinecke, and Tousey.

The report from the Committees on Markets, relative to the re appraise-

ment of Stalls in the East Market, (see pages 244 and 245, ante), was read,

and the action of the Common Council thereon, concurred in.

On motion, the Board of Aldermen then adjourned.

Attest: St^^Z/U ^^t) ^r?— 7 7™

[247]


